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Chia Liangwei is the Assistant EHS Manager of the Environmental, Health & Safety Unit for
Teambuild Engineering and Construction Pte Ltd. He's been in the building construction
industries since 2007 and spearheaded numerous initiatives in EHS making demonstrable
differences in enhancing the WSH performances in the workplaces and benefitting the whole
organisation and industry.

He takes the role of company senior trainer (EHS Management System) under the Career
Mentorship Program. Structurally developing and mentoring staff to strengthen their WSH
leadership, technical capabilities, and foundations.

He spearheads the Project Management and EHS Department to design new WSH
innovations and implements innovative solutions to enhance WSH standards in the
workplaces.

He collaborated with the Ministry Of Manpower, Workplace Safety and Health Council and
Housing & Development Board to share with the various authorities, key industry players
and foreign delegates on the successful achievement of a Workplace with Excellence in
WSH and Innovative WSH Solutions. In addition, he collaborated with Singapore National
Employers Federation and various Healthcare Professionals to conduct Workplace
Infectious Disease Education Programme, Health and Mental Well-Being Talks to his
workforce. He also shares on updated WSH-related matters, developments, incidents and
highlights learning points and recommendations on how similar incidents can be averted.

Amidst the COVID-19 pandemic, he is also one of the key members of the taskforce. Playing
a pivotal role working with various agencies to establish close communication and cascade
vital information to all key stakeholders. Establishing and implementing Safe Management
Measures within the company and leading the team in adapting to the new construction
normal.

Lastly, under his leadership and his relentless strive for WSH excellence, projects under his
charge have been honoured with numerous local and international accolades. As well as
achievements of individual professional awards, which include the WSHC bizSAFE
Champion Award 2015 & RoSPA Guardian Angel Award 2017.


